PUBLIC LAW 106-246—JULY 13, 2000 114 STAT. 569

NATIONAL AERONAUTICS AND SPACE ADMINISTRATION

SCIENCE, AERONAUTICS AND TECHNOLOGY

For an additional amount for “Science, aeronautics and tech-
nology”, $1,500,000, to remain available until September 30, 2001:
Provided, That the entire amount shall be available only to the
extent an official budget request, that includes designation of the
entire amount of the request as an emergency requirement as
defined by the Balanced Budget and Emergency Deficit Control
Act of 1985, as amended, is transmitted by the President to the
Congress: Provided further, That the entire amount is designated
by the Congress as an emergency requirement pursuant to section
251(b)(2)(A) of the Balanced Budget and Emergency Deficit Control
Act of 1985, as amended.

GENERAL PROVISIONS—THIS CHAPTER

SEcC. 2801. Title V, subtitle C, section 538 of Public Law 106—
74, is amended by striking “during any period that the assisted 42 USC 1437f.
family continues residing in the same project in which the family
was residing on the date of the eligibility event for the project,
if” and inserting “the assisted family may elect to remain in the
same project in which the family was residing on the date of
the eligibility event for the project, and if, during any period the
family makes such an election and continues to so reside,”.
SEC. 2802. Section 175 of Public Law 106-113 is amended 113 Stat. 1533.
by striking “as a grant for Special Olympics in Anchorage, Alaska
to develop the Ben Boeke Arena and Hilltop Ski Area,” and inserting
“to the Organizing Committee for the 2001 Special Olympics World
Winter games to be used in support of related activities in Alaska,”.
SEC. 2803. (a) TECHNICAL REVISION TO PUBLIC LAW 106-74.—
Title II of Public Law 106—74 is amended—
(1) under the heading “Urban Empowerment Zones”, by 113 Stat. 1060.
striking “$3,666,000” and inserting “$3,666,666”; and
(2) under the heading “Community Development Block 113 Stat. 1062.
Grants” under the fourth undesignated paragraph, by striking
“$23,000,000” and inserting “$22,750,000”.
(b) TEcHNICAL REVISION TO PUBLIC LAw 106-113.—Section
242(a) of Appendix E of Public Law 106-113 is amended— 113 Stat.
(1) by striking “seventh” and inserting “sixth”; and 1501A-303.
(2) by striking “$250,175,000” and inserting “$250,900,000”.
(¢c) EFFECTIVE DATES.—The amendments made by—
(1) subsection (a) shall be construed to have taken effect
on October 20, 1999; and
(2) subsection (b) shall be construed to have taken effect
on November 29, 1999.
SEC. 2804. SECTION 235 RESCISSION.—Section 208(3) of the
Departments of Veterans Affairs and Housing and Urban Develop-
ment, and Independent Agencies Appropriations Act, 2000 is 113 Stat. 1073.
amended—
(1) by striking “235(r)” and inserting “235”;
(2) by inserting after “104 Stat. 2305)” the following: “for
paﬁments under section 235(r) of the National Housing Act”;
an
(3) by striking “for such purposes”.



